QUOTE TABULATION
2012-45R Carpet Cleaning Annual Contract
6/14/2012 - 6/13/2013

ASURE BRAZOS BOLLERS
CARPET THE BEST STANLEY ADVANCED CARPET
AREA TO BE CLEANED | EST. 8SQ FT.| CLEANING | STEAMERY | CARPET STEAMER CARPET |STEAMATIC |CLEANING
AG EXTENSION 1625 $ 24300] % 250.00}% 211251% 203.13 INOBID NO BID NO BiD
ANNEX 12639 $ 154500{ % 1,770.00]% 1,643.071% 1,579.88 [NOBID NO BID NO BID
BRAZOS CENTER 2715 $ 39500]% 395001]% 3529513 339.38 [NOBID NO BiD NO BID
GENERAL BUILDING 794 $ 10000|8% 1100039 10322 | 9% 99.25 INO BID NO BID NO BID
HEALTH DEPT. 4100 $ 24600013 24600018 2,132.001 % 2,050.00 INOBID NO BID NO BID
JUVENILE JUSTICE CNTR 15492 $ 3,800.00|% 38800019 402792 1% 3,873.00 fNO BID NO BID NO BID
ROAD & BRIDGE 1943 $ 27500]% 2700019 25269 | % 242.88 [INOBID NO BID NO BID
TAX OFFICE 6080 $ 90000|% 89500]% 7904018 760.00 INOBID NO BID NO BID
IMAXWELL 8500 $ 1,10000]1% 1,190.0018 1,105.00 { $§ 1,062.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
JPPCT. 3 2450 $ 35000|8$ 340009 31850 ] $ 306.25 INO BID NO BID NO BID
COURTHOUSE 62217 $ 6210001 % 63330019 8,088.21 |8 7,777.13 INOBID NO BID NO BiD
ADMIN BLDG 37600 $ 35000018 467000]8% 4,888.00 {$ 4,700.00 JNO BID NO BID NO BID
SHERIFF'S BLDG 9200 $ 1,000.00]9$ 12800019 1,196.00 | $ 1,150.00 INOBID NO BID NO BID
EXPO BLDG 2000 $ 30000|% 30000(8% 260.00|$ 25000 }- NO BID NO BID
TOTALS $22178.00 § $24,143.00 | $ 25369.11 1 $24,393.40 INOBID NO BID NO BID
PURCHASING RECOMMENDS AWARD TO ASURE CARPET CLEANING
Approved by Commissioner’s Court on this day of , 2012 by
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