ITB 2019-035
PRINT AND MAIL SEASONAL ACTIVITY GUIDE

BID COMPARISON

PRINTING OPTION #1

Twenty (20) Page Self-Cover Guide

Size: Flat: 22.75" x 13.75"; Folded to 11.75" x 6.875", Bindery: Quarterfold Total for
Stock: #35 Newsprint, 75 Brightness Printing and
Bidder ", Mailingfor
Printing Cost for E;:h :csld::::;“ Four (4) Mailing Twenty (20)
gesp Pages Only
Unit Price | Estimated Unit Price | Estimated Unit Price | Estimated
(per Quarterly Total (per Quarterly Total (per Quarterly Total
Piece) Quantity Piece) Quantity Piece) Quantity
ﬁfg Media of Chesapeakell ¢, 1513|  40,000] $4,852.00| $0.02027 40,000  $810.80  $0.0100 40,000  $400.00 $5,662.80
Bartash Printing Inc. $0.1200 40,000| $4,800.00 $0.0160 40,000 $640.00 $0.0180 40,000 $720.00 $5,520.00
Indiana Printing and
Publishing Company, Inc. $0.1160 40,000| $4,640.00 $0.0150 40,000 $600.00 $0.1160 40,000 $4,640.00 $9,280.00
Post Community Media
dba Comprint Printing $0.1300 40,000| $5,200.00 $0.0071 40,000 $284.00 $0.1300 40,000/ $5,200.00 $10,400.00
ZIP Mailing Services Inc. $0.3135 40,000| $12,540.00 $0.0627 40,000 $2,508.00| $0.03265 40,000/ $1,306.00 $13,846.00
21st Century Media News . ;
dba Nittany Valley Offset No Bid No Bid
Sights Production No Bid No Bid
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BID COMPARISON (continued)

PRINTING OPTION #2

Twenty (20) Page Self-Cover Guide

Size: Flat: 17" x 11"; Folded to 8.5" x 11", Bindery: Fold in Half and Stitch Total for
Stock: 80# Gloss White Printing and
Bidder ca- Mailingfor
Printing Cost for Ei;h :csld:;::;ﬂ Four (4) Mailing Twenty (20)
ge >p Pages Only
Unit Price | Estimated Unit Price | Estimated Unit Price | Estimated
(per Quarterly Total (per Quarterly Total (per Quarterly Total
Piece) Quantity Piece) Quantity Piece) Quantity
ZIP Mailing Services Inc. $0.2435 40,000| $9,740.00 $0.0496 40,000| $1,984.00f $0.03265 40,000 $1,306.00 $11,046.00
21st Century Media News
dba Nittany Valley Offset $0.2420 40,000| $9,680.00 $0.0330 40,000 $1,320.00 $0.0550 40,000/  $2,200.00 $11,880.00
Sights Production $0.33065 40,000| $13,226.00[ $0.06613 40,000| $2,645.20[ $0.07285 40,000| $2,914.00 $16,140.00
Indiana Printing and
Publishing Company, Inc. $0.2620 40,000| $10,480.00 $0.222 40,000/ $8,880.00 $0.2620 40,000/ $10,480.00 $20,960.00
APG Media of Chesapeake No Bid No Bid
LLC
Post Community Media . )
dba Comprint Printing No Bid No Bid
Bartash Printing Inc. N/A N/A
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BID COMPARISON (continued)

PRINTING OPTION #3

Twenty (20) Page Self-Cover Guide

Size: Flat: 17" x 11"; Folded to 8.5" x 11", Bindery: Fold in Half and Saddle Stitch Total for
Stock: Cover: 80# Gloss White Cover, #35 Newsprint, 75 Brightness Printing and
Bidder o Mailingfor
Printing Cost for Ei;h :csld:;::;ﬂ Four (4) Mailing Twenty (20)
ge >p Pages Only
Unit Price | Estimated Unit Price | Estimated Unit Price | Estimated
(per Quarterly Total (per Quarterly Total (per Quarterly Total
Piece) Quantity Piece) Quantity Piece) Quantity
Bartash Printing Inc. $0.1400 40,000 $5,600.00 $0.1400 40,000 $5,600.00 $0.0180 40,000 $720.00 $6,320.00
ZIP Mailing Services Inc. $0.2435 40,000 $9,740.00 $0.0496 40,000( $1,984.00f $0.03265 40,000( $1,306.00 $11,046.00
Indiana Printing and
Publishing Company, Inc. $0.1870 40,000 $7,480.00 $0.0070 40,000 $280.00 $0.1870 40,000 $7,480.00 $14,960.00
Sights Production $0.3193 40,000( $12,772.00 $0.0639 40,000( $2,554.40 $0.0641 40,000( $2,564.00 $15,336.00
APG Media of Chesapeake No Bid No Bid
LLC
21st Century Media News . :
dba Nittany Valley Offset No Bid No Bid
Post Community Media No Bid No Bid

dba Comprint Printing
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BID COMPARISON (continued)

PRINTING OPTION #4
Twenty (20) Page Self-Cover Guide
Size: Flat: 16" x 10-1/2"; Folded to 8" x 10-1/2", Bindery: Fold in Half and Saddle Stitch Total for
Stock: Cover: 80# Gloss White Cover, #35 Newsprint, 75 Brightness Printing and
Bidder Printin Cost for Each Additional Four (4) Mailin Mailingfor
9 Page Spread) 9 Twenty (20)
Pages Only
Unit Price | Estimated Unit Price | Estimated Unit Price | Estimated
(per Quarterly Total (per Quarterly Total (per Quarterly Total
Piece) Quantity Piece) Quantity Piece) Quantity
fchlMed'a of Chesapeake|l  ¢51477| 40,000 $5908.00]  $0.0202 40,000  $808.00 $0.01| 40,000  $400.00 6,308.00
ZIP Mailing Services Inc. $0.2435 40,000| $9,740.00 $0.0496 40,000| $1,984.00f $0.03265 40,000 $1,306.00 11,046.00
Sights Production $0.3193 40,000| $12,772.00[ $0.06386 40,000| $2,554.40 $0.0641 40,000| $2,564.00 15,336.00
Indiana Printing and
Publishing Company, Inc. $0.2280 40,000| $9,120.00 $0.0190 40,000 $760.00 $0.2280 40,000| $9,120.00 18,240.00
21st Century Media News . :
dba Nittany Valley Offset No Bid No Bid
Post Community Media .
dba Comprint Printing $0.1300 40,000 $5,200.00“ $0.0071 40,000 $284.00 No Bid Unknown
Bartash Printing Inc.2 40,000 “ 40,000 40,000

1 Cost for additional page spread, offering eight (8) page and not four (4) page as specified.
2 Just left areas blank.



