
 

    

 
 

 
 
 

Devon & Cornwall Police 
 

Record 1  
 

 

Freedom of Information Act Request No: 003131/12  
 
 

1. Please confirm if your organisation has a Preferred Supplier List/Framework 

Agreement for the supply of contingent labour (temporary, contract, interim) or 

permanent IT/ICT staff? For example, this could include positions including IT 

Support, Installation, Software Developers, Technical Architects etc. 

 

2. If yes, how many organisations are contracted to the Preferred Supplier 

List/Framework Agreement? Please provide the company names. 

 

3. Please confirm if your organisation has a Preferred Supplier List/Framework 

Agreement for the supply of contingent labour (temporary, contract, interim) or 

permanent Project and Programme Management (PPM) staff? For example this 

could include positions including Change/Transformation Managers, Business 

Analysts, Commercial Managers, Project Support Officers etc. 

 

4. If yes, how many organisations are contracted to the Preferred Supplier 

List/Framework Agreement? Please provide the company names. 

 

5. Please detail the start and end dates of the above contracts? 

 

6. Please detail your confirmed spend on the recruitment of IT and PPM 

contingent labour for the financial year 2010/11 and the most up to date spend 

figures for 2011/12.  

 

7. Please provide a copy or, if publically available online, a link to your 

Corporate Plan and ICT Strategy. 

 

8. Please provide an Organisational Chart (or Charts if broken down by 

department) showing your organisational structure. 

 

9. Please provide the following details for the following staff including Name, 

Telephone Number and email address: 

 

a. Chief Information Officer 

b. Chief Technology Officer  

c. IT Director 

d. Head of Projects/Programmes 

e. Head of Service Delivery 



 

    

f. Commercial/Procurement Director  

g. Commercial/Procurement Manager 

h. Category Lead for Contract Recruitment 

 
 
 
The Procurement and ICT Departments have provided the following information: 
 

1. Please confirm if your organisation has a Preferred Supplier List/Framework 

Agreement for the supply of contingent labour (temporary, contract, interim) or 

permanent IT/ICT staff? For example, this could include positions including IT 

Support, Installation, Software Developers, Technical Architects etc. 
 
Devon and Cornwall Constabulary currently uses a Thames Valley Police Framework for 
the supply of temporary / agency staff. In addition, we have used Government 
Procurement Service frameworks to secure the services of project management staff. 
 

2. If yes, how many organisations are contracted to the Preferred Supplier 

List/Framework Agreement? Please provide the company names. 

 
Please refer to Government Procurement Service for the list of companies on the 
respective frameworks, namely RM353. This information is available on the internet and 
so engages the exemption from disclosure, section 21 – Information available elsewhere 
of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. A link has been provided to assist you:  
 
RM353 
http://www.buyingsolutions.gov.uk/catalogue/suppliers.html?contract_id=512&from=contra
cts 
 
RM46b/L1 
http://www.buyingsolutions.gov.uk/catalogue/suppliers.html?contract_id=708 
 
RM46b/L2 
http://www.buyingsolutions.gov.uk/catalogue/suppliers.html?contract_id=709 
 
With regards to the Thames Valley Police framework, the suppliers listed thereon are: 
 
Select Appointments 
Hays Specialist Recruitment 
Reed Personnel Services Ltd 
Adecco UK Ltd 

 

3. Please confirm if your organisation has a Preferred SupplierList/Framework 

Agreement for the supply of contingent labour (temporary, contract, interim) or 

permanent Project and Programme Management (PPM) staff? For example this 

could include positions including Change/Transformation Managers, Business 

Analysts, Commercial Managers, Project Support Officers etc. 

 
As per Frameworks listed above. Typically the Force would run some kind of mini 
competition to select a company from the Framework. If using the Thames Valley 
framework then Hays is the current selected supplier. 

 

http://www.buyingsolutions.gov.uk/catalogue/suppliers.html?contract_id=512&from=contracts
http://www.buyingsolutions.gov.uk/catalogue/suppliers.html?contract_id=512&from=contracts
http://www.buyingsolutions.gov.uk/catalogue/suppliers.html?contract_id=708
http://www.buyingsolutions.gov.uk/catalogue/suppliers.html?contract_id=709


 

    

4. If yes, how many organisations are contracted to the Preferred Supplier 

List/Framework Agreement? Please provide the company names. 

 
See above 

 

5. Please detail the start and end dates of the above contracts? 

 
The start and end dates for the TVP framework are 01/04/2009 to 31/03/2013. 
Please refer to Government Procurement Services for the start and end dates of the 
above mentioned frameworks (links provided above).  
 
We list all awarded contracts on our buyer profile on the Force website: 
www.devon-cornwall.police.uk/tenders 

 

6. Please detail your confirmed spend on the recruitment of IT and PPM 

contingent labour for the financial year 2010/11 and the most up to date spend 

figures for 2011/12.  

 
Devon and Cornwall Constabulary do not hold a total spend specifically for recruitment of 
IT and PPM Contingent Labour. These costs are incorporated into a wider budget and 
cannot be separated out.  

 

 

7. Please provide a copy or, if publically available online, a link to your 

Corporate Plan and ICT Strategy. 

 
Please see Record 2.  

 

8. Please provide an Organisational Chart (or Charts if broken down by 

department) showing your organisational structure. 

 
Devon & Cornwall Constabulary do not hold a full organisational structure chart at the 
moment. However, we hope to have one uploaded to the website in the next few weeks.  
 

9. Please provide the following details for the following staff including Name, 

Telephone Number and email address: 

 

a. Chief Information Officer 

 
Louise Fenwick – Head of Information Management 

 

b. Chief Technology Officer  

 
This is the same person give at c.  

 

c. IT Director 

 
This part of your request engages the exemption from disclosure section 21 – Information 
available elsewhere of the Freedom of information Act 2000. A link has been provided to 
where this information can be found in the public domain: 
 

http://www.devon-cornwall.police.uk/tenders


 

    

http://www.devon-
cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Att
achments/796/Record%201.pdf 

 

d. Head of Projects/Programmes 

 
Ch/Supt Swani 

 

e. Head of Service Delivery 

 
This is the same person given at c.  

 

f. Commercial/Procurement Director 

 
Previously disclosed. See link in c.   
 

g. Commercial/Procurement Manager 

 
As above. 

 

h. Category Lead for Contract Recruitment 

 
Kathryn Parker – Category Manager, Professional Services 
 
 
 

You may also be interested in the following disclosures made previously by this 

Unit: 
231/2009-0829 – Full Disc 
http://www.devon-
cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Att
achments/194/Record%201.pdf 
161/2010-0577 – Full Disc 
http://www.devon-
cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Att
achments/796/Record%201.pdf 
2800/10 – Part disc  
http://www.devon-
cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Att
achments/1257/Record%201%20-%202800.pdf 

 

http://www.devon-cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Attachments/796/Record%201.pdf
http://www.devon-cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Attachments/796/Record%201.pdf
http://www.devon-cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Attachments/796/Record%201.pdf
http://www.devon-cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Attachments/194/Record%201.pdf
http://www.devon-cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Attachments/194/Record%201.pdf
http://www.devon-cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Attachments/194/Record%201.pdf
http://www.devon-cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Attachments/796/Record%201.pdf
http://www.devon-cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Attachments/796/Record%201.pdf
http://www.devon-cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Attachments/796/Record%201.pdf
http://www.devon-cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Attachments/1257/Record%201%20-%202800.pdf
http://www.devon-cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Attachments/1257/Record%201%20-%202800.pdf
http://www.devon-cornwall.police.uk/YourRightInformation/FreedomInformation/Lists/Disclosure%20Logs/Attachments/1257/Record%201%20-%202800.pdf

